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SUPPER CANCELED
The Jefferson Center United Meth-
odist Church Soup Supper,
scheduled for February 13 was
cancelled due to weather.  It will
be rescheduled – so watch the
Warren Weekly for more informa-
tion.

LENTEN BIBLE STUDY
A community Lenten Bible Study
of the Book of First Corinthians
will take place on Saturday nights
starting February 24 and con-
tinuing through April 1 at
Applegate Chapel at Heritage
Pointe, Warren. Each session
will start at 7:00 p.m. and will be
broadcast over closed circuit tele-
vision to residents.   The study is
co-sponsored by the Heritage
Pointe Chaplaincy department
and area churches. Rev. Edwin
Clark, retired after 45 years in the
active ministry in Indiana, includ-
ing 25 years with the North Indi-
ana Conference of the United
Methodist Church, and currently
on staff of the Chaplaincy depart-
ment, will be the presenter. First
Corinthians was chosen because
the issues raised in the book [
such as division within the church,
marriage responsibilities, speak-
ing in tongues, sex and sexual
improprieties, the way of human
love, the Lord’s Supper, proper
use of spiritual gifts in life and
worship, and the issues of death
and resurrection ] are also is-
sues being raised within the
modern church, calling for all
people of faith to meditate on
their personal relationship with
the Church and God Himself dur-
ing the forty days of Lent and
beyond.
  Members of all churches and
their friends, residents of Heri-
tage Pointe, Dogwood Villas, and
Woodridge, citizens of Warren,
and the surrounding community
are invited to attend.

RESULTS IN
The Results of the Great Warren
Survey are in!
  Over 250 people responded and
shared their views on what they
wanted in Warren.
  The front runners in the survey
were: Grocery store, license
branch, restaurant and hardware
store, rounding out the rest were
requests for tanning beds, copy
store, coffee shop, meat shop,
bookstore and carwash.
  Thank you for your overwhelm-
ing interest. We will use the re-
sults of this survey to draw busi-
nesses to our community. The
committee’s next goal is to ob-
tain the status of our available
downtown retail spaces.

COUNTY BASEBALL
Huntington County Baseball Sign
up and call out.
  Baseball Ages 7-17
  Girls Softball Ages 6-16
  Saturday, Feb 17th and Feb
24th 10:00 a.m.- 12:00 p.m. at
the Knight Bergman Civic Center
Players and coaches needed.
  Questions call: Tim Leidig 375-
3340  (New and current players
need to register at one of these
times)

CLOTHING SWAP
Do you have a closet full of clothes
the kids won’t be able to wear
this spring? Maybe you finally
lost the 10 pounds that just
wouldn’t go away and your clothes
don’t fit anymore. The First Bap-
tist Church located at 727 N.
Wayne Street in Warren has the
solution for you. On Saturday,
March 10th from 9:00 a.m. - 12:00
p.m., we will be hosting a cloth-
ing swap. The church will be
accepting clothing donations the
week prior to the swap. Don’t
have any clothes to donate. No
problem, come and shop any-
way. Clothing drop off times will
be the week of March 5th on
Monday, Wednesday and Thurs-
day from 9:00-11:00 a.m.

Wednesday evening from 6:00-
7:00 p.m. and Friday from 1:00-
4:00 p.m   Clothing should be
clean and free of holes. Please
call 375-3340 with any questions.

VB LIBRARY NEWS
The library has state and federal
income tax forms available. Just
stop in to get what you need. We
also have the free 2007 Indiana
Travel Guide.
  The Van Buren Public Library
has received monies from the
Grant County Community Foun-
dation. Eastbrook Junior High
student Davis Guebert, and coun-
selor Kathy Wood wrote the grant
for the library. The library will
purchase Young Hoosier Award
books with the funds. Thank you
for thinking of and supporting the
library.

PANCAKE SUPPER
The Warren United Church of
Christ is having a Pancake and
Sausage Supper on Tuesday,
February 20th, at the Knight-
Bergman Center, from 5:00 - 7:00
PM.  Price is:  adults - $5.00;
kids ages 5-11 - $2.50; and kids
under 5 are free.
  This is on Fat Tuesday, also
known as International Pancake
Day.  Fat Tuesday is the end of
Mardi Gras and the day before
Ash Wednesday, the beginning
of Lent.  This day is the day that
people would finish up yeasts
and fats of food preparation and
start a blander diet for Lent.  It
was a sign of what you would give
of yourself for your faith in Jesus
Christ.
  This giving up is ages old and is
a reminder of what Jesus gave up
as He came to earth to serve
humanity and to give up His life
for us to have a ground for re-
demption.
  In England, Fat Tuesday, or
Shrove Tuesday, was a day for
celebration before Lent.  Com-
munities challenged each other
to see who could be the best at

flipping pancakes while running a
race.
  So, enjoy this day by coming to
this supper and may you be ready
to observe a Holy and Meaningful
Lent.

BASKET BINGO
P.I.E. (Partners In Education) of
Southern Wells Elementary
School will be sponsoring a
Longaberger Basket Bingo on
Saturday, March 3 at Southern
Wells Community Schools in the
high school cafeteria.  The ad-
dress is 9120S 300W, Poneto.
Cost will be $15 for 20 games.
One original Longaberger basket
will be given away for each game.
Doors open at 9:15 a.m., games
begin at 10 a.m.  Concessions
will be available.  You must be 18
years or older to attend.  For
tickets, contact Katina Samsel
765/348-1333 or 765/499-1072,
Jean Lefebvre 765/728-5708 or
260/403-6924 or Southern Wells
Elementary office 765/728-2121.
  Raffle tickets will be available in
house – length of one arm for
$5.00
  Proceeds benefit Southern
Wells Elementary.

COUNCIL NOTES
  by Bonnie Lloyd
The Van Buren Town Council
held a short meeting on Wednes-
day evening, Feb. 7.  President
Tony Manry conducted the meet-
ing which opened at 7 p.m.  All in
attendance repeated the Pledge
to the American Flag.
  Minutes of the previous meet-
ing were approved as submitted.
  A discussion was held con-
cerning guard rails in front of the
Fire Station and Town Hall.  Fire
Chief Rex Huffman suggested a
rail be placed in front of the fire
hydrant.  The hydrant had been
destroyed recently when it was
believed to have been hit by a
semi.  The guard rails will prevent
large trucks and semis from turn-
ing around in the lot.

  Bob White announced that
seven new members are in train-
ing for the Fire Department.
  Council passed Resolution 1-
2007 to raise mileage rate to 40¢
per mile.
  The next Council meeting will
be held Feb. 21.

TRACTOR MEETINGS

Huntington County 4-H Tractor
club meetings will begin on Mon-
day, February 19 at Dennis Grain,
587 E 800 N, Huntington.  Three
additional meetings will be held
on Monday, February 26 at
Koenig Equipment, State Road 9
North, Huntington; Tuesday,
March 6 at Heritage Hall, Hier’s
Park; and on Monday, March 12
at Wertenberger Tire, 1400 S
Jefferson Street, Huntington.  All
four meetings will be from 7:00-
8:30 pm.
  The 4-H tractor program pro-
vides youth with educational in-
formation about tractors and
machinery that develops project
skills (i.e., principles of engine
operation, hydraulic systems,
electrical systems, safe opera-
tion) and life skills (i.e., decision
making, using science and tech-
nology, developing communica-
tion skills).  Youth may choose
to focus on small tractors (lawn &
garden) or on larger tractors (farm
& ag).  In both categories, youth
have the opportunity to partici-
pate in the tractor operator’s con-
test and to display a poster at the
annual Huntington County 4-H
Fair for an exhibit.  The County
Tractor Operator’s Contest will
be Sunday, July 8 at the Show
Arena, Hier’s Park.
  Any youth in grades 3 through
12 is encouraged to participate in
the 4-H Tractor project and the
four winter classroom meetings.
For more information, contact
the Huntington County Office of
the Purdue Cooperative Exten-
sion Service, 354 N Jefferson –
Suite 202 or phone 260-358-4826
or email laldridg@purdue.edu.
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KUDOS, KICKS & KARATS

MEMBER FDIC

Warren Community

Banking Center

450 Bennett Dr.

260-375-4550  or  888-758-3111

Strong  & Secure Since 1947

www.marklebank.com

Serving Warren &

Liberty Center

375-2111

Your
"Internet Connection"

D & D BIKE
Over 200 in Stock

Phone 375-3828 or

1-800-356-4440

Downtown Warren

CITIZENS

TELEPHONE

CORP.

Zeller  Construction

Owner:  Larry Highley

 375-3477 or 260/359-2331
Pole Barns, New Homes,

Remodeling, Garages, Siding,

Windows & Roofing

HEYDE OIL INC.
d/b/a

Huggy Bear
Ice Cream Stop and

Huggy Bear Quik Stop
& Motel

P O Box 326

801 Htgn Ave

Warren, IN  46792

UMMH.org

260-375-2201

ASBURY CHAPEL

UNITED METHODIST

8013W 1100S - 90, Montpelier

Rev. John Wallace, Pastor

Worship ............................... 9:30 a.m.

Sunday School ....................10:30 a.m.

Wed Evening Carry-in & Fellowship

        ......................................6:30 p.m.

BANQUO CHRISTIAN CHURCH

8294S 900W 35

Gary Riley, Pastor

Sunday School ......................9:30 a.m.

Worship ............................. 10:30 a.m.

Youth Choir Practice ............ 5:00 p.m.

Wed. Bible Study ..................6:30 p.m.

Thurs. Kings Kids ..................6:30 p.m.

BYG Youth Svc. (2&4Sun.) .. 6:00 p.m.

CWF Ladies (3 Tue) ..............6:00 p.m.

1st Sun. (Qtrly) Praise Hour.. 6:30 p.m.

BOEHMER UNITED METHODIST

Rev. Barry Humble, Pastor

Joe Kober, S.S. Supt.

Sunday Worship  ................... 9:30a.m.

Sunday School .................... 10:30a.m.

BUCKEYE CHRISTIAN CHURCH

758-2085

Kyle Dahlquist, Pastor

Sandy Keplinger, Supt.

Worship ................................9:30 a.m.

Sunday School ....................10:45 a.m.

CENTRAL CHRISTIAN CHURCH

Van Buren, Indiana  765-934-2199

Pastor Anna Kroencke

Worship ................................9:30 a.m.

Sunday School ....................10:40 a.m.

Bible Study, Wednesday......10:00 a.m.

Youth Fellowship Sun ...........6:00 p.m.

THE CHRISTIAN & MISSIONARY

ALLIANCE — Majenica

Rev. Gus Hacker

Sunday School ......................9:30 a.m.

Worship ..............................10:30 a.m.

Sunday Evening  ...................6:00 p.m.

Wednesday Worship .............7:00 p.m.

DILLMAN UNITED BRETHREN

8888S 1100W-90, Warren  375-2779

Dick Case, Pastor

Sun - 1st Worship Service..... 8:15a.m.

           Sunday School.............9:30a.m.

        2nd Worship Service ....10:30a.m.

          Youth Group (6th-12th).6:00p.m.

Wed - Circle of Friends

        (3yrs old - 5th grade) . 6:30-8p.m.

HANFIELD UNITED METHODIST

101 N 400 E - Marion 765/664-8726

Timothy Helm, Senior Pastor

1st Worship............................9:00 a.m.

2nd Worship.........................10:30 a.m.

3rd Worship ........................11:11 a.m.

HERITAGE POINTE

Sunday Morning Worship ......9:30 a.m.

OTHER  SERVICES  BY ANNOUNCEMENT

Tues, Thurs, Fri & Sat

Chapel Services ....................9:00 a.m.

HILLCREST

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE

375-2510

Clyde Gunn, Pastor

Bus Service 375-2510

Sunday School ......................9:30 a.m.

Worship ..............................10:30 a.m.

Evening Worship....................6:00 p.m.

Youth Group (Wed.)...............6:00 p.m.

Wed. Midweek Service...........6:30 p.m.

JEFFERSON CENTER

UNITED METHODIST

Corner of 900S & 300W

Kathy Newton, Pastor

Sunday School ......................8:45 a.m.

Worship Service ..................10:00 a.m.

LANCASTER WESLEYAN

468-2411

Doug Sharrard, Pastor

David Thrift, S.S. Supt.

Sunday School ......................9:30 a.m.

Worship ..............................10:30 a.m.

Wednesday:

CYC/Teen/Adult Meetings .... 7:00 p.m.

LIBERTY CENTER BAPTIST CHURCH

694-6622

Pastor Dan Sommer

Sunday School ......................9:00 a.m.

Fellowship ............................. 9:55a.m.

Worship .............................. 10:15a.m.

Wed. Bible Study ................. 7:00 p.m.

LIBERTY CENTER

UNITED METHODIST CHURCH

Dan Helm, Pastor

Morning Worship ...................9:30 a.m.

Sunday School ....................10:45 a.m.

McNATT UNITED METHODIST

375-4359

Bill VanHaften, Pastor

Lois Slusher, Supt.

Coffee Fellowship..................8:30 a.m.

Worship ................................9:15 a.m.

Sunday School ....................10:30 a.m.

Bible Study - Wed. ............... 7:00 p.m.

MT. ETNA  UNITED METHODIST

260/468-2148

Rev. Tom DeFries - Pastor

Trad. Worship .....................  9:00 a.m.

Mdrn Worship ..................... 10:30 a.m.

Fellowship & Classes ..........  9:30 a.m.

Kids Club, Youth Group & Adult Studies

- all Sunday ............. 6:00 p.m.

MOUNT ETNA WESLEYAN

Rev. Charles Dederick, Pastor

Sunday School ......................9:30 a.m.

Worship ..............................10:30 a.m.

Sunday Evening  ...................6:00 p.m.

Mid-Week (Wed)  ..................6:00 p.m.

THE NEW BEGINNING

SR 218, 2 1/8 mile west of Poneto

Steve Sutton, Pastor

765/728-2065 for more info

Sunday Worship....................10:30a.m.

ThursdayPrayer Meeting ...... 7:00 p.m.

PLUM TREE

UNITED CHURCH OF CHRIST

375-2691

Dr. Jeane Spoor, Pastor

Sunday School .....................9:30 a.m.

Worship ..............................10:30 a.m.

SALAMONIE

CHURCH OF BRETHREN

468-2412

Mel Zumbrun,  Pastor

Worship ................................9:30 a.m.

Church School .....................10:45a.m.

UNITED CHURCH OF CHRIST

375-2102

Rev. Rick Pulling, Interim Pastor

Sunday Worship................... 9:30 a.m.

Junior Church .................... 10:00 a.m.

Sunday School .................. 10:30 a.m.

Communion 1st Sunday of the Month

Fun Factory 1st/3rd Sundays ...6:00p.m.

VB CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE

765/934-3321 Parsonage

Jeff Wass, Pastor

Sunday School ...................  9:30 a.m.

Adult Worship .....................10:30 a.m.

Children’s Church ............... 10:30a.m.

Evening Praise Hour.............. 6:00p.m.

Hour of Power (Wed) ........... 7:00p.m.

VB UNITED METHODIST CHURCH

765-934-1431

Pastor Blake J. Neff

Worship Service .................. 9:30 a.m.

Sunday School  .................. 10:30a.m.

Jr/Sr High UMYF  (Sun)........ 6:30 p.m.

Prayer-Bible Study (Thur).... 7:30 p.m.

UMW 2nd Wed .................... 7:00 p.m.

www.vanburenumc.org

WARREN CHURCH OF CHRIST

375-3022

Gerald O. Moreland, Minister

Todd Winkler, Youth Minister

Ruth Moreland, Secretary & BS Supt.

Fellowship  ...........................9:15 a.m.

Worship & Communion .........9:30 a.m.

Sunday School ...................10:45 a.m.

WARREN 1st BAPTIST CHURCH

Corner of N. Wayne & Matilda Sts.

Rev. Bill Fisher, Pastor of

Preaching and Discipleship

Rev. Robert Bothast, Pastor of

Family Life

Lori Buzzard, S.S. Supt.

Sunday School .....................9:00 a.m.

Sunday  Worship ................10:00 a.m.

Sunday Evening Service .....  6:00p.m.

WARREN  UNITED  METHODIST

Rev. Mike Malone, Pastor

Sunday School .....................9:30 a.m.

Worship ..............................10:30 a.m.

Handicap Accessible & Staff Nursery

 WARREN  WESLEYAN  CHURCH

375-2330  6th & Nancy Sts. Warren

Rev. Andy Trowbridge, Pastor

Wesley Welch, Supt.

Sunday School .....................9:30 a.m.

Worship ..............................10:15 a.m.

 Wednesday Prayer Service..7:00p.m.

Attend  the Church of Your Choice

THE HISTORY OF VALENTINE’S DAY
Every February, across the country, candy, flowers, and gifts are
exchanged between loved ones, all in the name of St. Valentine. But
who is this mysterious saint and why do we celebrate this holiday?
The history of Valentine’s Day — and its patron saint — is shrouded
in mystery. But we do know that February has long been a month of
romance. St. Valentine’s Day, as we know it today, contains
vestiges of both Christian and ancient Roman tradition. So, who was
Saint Valentine and how did he become associated with this ancient
rite? Today, the Catholic Church recognizes at least three different
saints named Valentine or Valentinus, all of whom were martyred.
  One legend contends that Valentine was a priest who served during
the third century in Rome. When Emperor Claudius II decided that
single men made better soldiers than those with wives and families,
he outlawed marriage for young men — his crop of potential soldiers.
Valentine, realizing the injustice of the decree, defied Claudius and
continued to perform marriages for young lovers in secret. When
Valentine’s actions were discovered, Claudius ordered that he be put
to death.
  Other stories suggest that Valentine may have been killed for
attempting to help Christians escape harsh Roman prisons where
they were often beaten and tortured.
  According to one legend, Valentine actually sent the first ‘valentine’
greeting himself. While in prison, it is believed that Valentine fell in
love with a young girl — who may have been his jailor’s daughter —
who visited him during his confinement. Before his death, it is alleged
that he wrote her a letter, which he signed ‘From your Valentine,’ an
expression that is still in use today. Although the truth behind the
Valentine legends is murky, the stories certainly emphasize his
appeal as a sympathetic, heroic, and, most importantly, romantic
figure. It’s no surprise that by the Middle Ages, Valentine was one of
the most popular saints in England and France.
  Special thanks to American Greetings.
  Hope you remembered your Valentine this year – if not you could
always blame it on the weather.

TIPS TO BUILD READING SUCCESS
(NewsUSA) - Children have limitless imaginations. They may dream
of time travel and seeing prehistoric creatures up close. Perhaps they
want to become mysterious sorcerers who cast binding spells.
Parents can easily accommodate these whimsical wishes by
encouraging their children to read.
  When students turn the pages of a book, they unlock the door to
a reading wonderland. Indeed, fostering a love of reading can mean
more than succeeding on a school assignment; cherishing the power
of words on the written page can be the catalyst that leads to success
in school and life.
  But for some parents, it is difficult to get their kids excited about
reading.
  “Reading should be a daily occurrence, just like brushing your
teeth,” said Reg Weaver, president of the National Education
Association. “If you work with your children to make the activity fun,
the rest will fall into place.”
  Resources for parents are available through NEA’s Read Across
America program, now in its 10th year. This year-round literacy
campaign stresses the importance of motivating children to read and
helping them master basic reading skills. The organization offers

CONTINUED PAGE 8
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Garages • Workshops

Horse Barns • Mini-Storage

Farm • Suburban • Business

“The Building People”

800-742-2861

MEYER BUILDING
Craigville, IN

www.meyerbuilding.com

CALL US ABOUT
WINTER DISCOUNT

Community  Calendar
   Items listed here are open to the public.  If  there is an admission
charge or items are for sale or a donation is necessary, there is a
one-time $5 fee to be listed.    Events can be listed for as long as 6
months. (If an  event is cancelled, please notify WW.)   Only event,
place, time, and sponsor, for events in  Warren, and the surrounding
area will be listed.

Feb 16 Warren Recycle Day

Feb 19 PRESIDENT'S DAY
Feb 21 Van Buren Town Council 7 p.m.

Feb 24 Warren Sportsman's Club Soup Supper, 5 to 8 p.m.

Feb 26 Warren Town Council, 6:30 p.m., Assembly Hall

Mar 2 Warren Recycle Day

Mar 7 Warren Chamber of Commerce, noon, Assembly

Hall

Mar 7 Van Buren Town Council, 7p.m.

Mar 10 KBC Board Meeting 8 a.m. at KBC

Mar 12 Warren Town Council, 6:30 p.m., Assembly Hall

Mar 13 Our Town Committee Meeting, 7 p.m., Assembly Hall

Mar 16 Warren Recycle Day

Mar 17 ST PATRICK's DAY
May 12 Warren Alumni Banquet - 5:30 p.m. Jim Howell

375-3048

Bread of Life Food Pantry - Wed 4 - 5:30pm, Sat 10 - 11:30 at KBC

or by appointment - Call 375-2381.  Bargain Basement - Friday &

Saturday 9  - 4 at KBC Depression Support Group 2nd & 4th Thurs at

Hope Missionary Church, Bluffton 6-7:30 After School Adventure -

Tuesdays & Thursdays, after school till 5:30 p.m. at Hillcrest Church

of the Nazarene Preschool Story Time - Warren Library 10:30

Fridays Walking in the Gym - at KBC 7-11a.m. Monday thru Friday.

HALLMARK CHANNEL HAS BEEN

ADDED TO OUR BASIC PACKAGE

YOU WILL FIND THIS ON CHANNEL #39

EFFECTIVE IMMEDIATELY

SPECIAL

ANNOUNCEMENT

FROM

WARREN CABLE

PJ's Flower & Gift Shop
M-T-W-F 9-5; Th & S 9-12
114 N Wayne St, Warren

(260)375-2702

Fresh/Silk Flowers       Music Boxes

Green/Blooming Plants       Stuffed Animals

Gifts/Greeting Cards    Balloons/Party Supplies

and much more!

60

60

Make sure to wish

Deanna Hicks Gray

Roberts

a "Big" Happy

60th Birthday

February 16th

BUS TRIP
The Salamonie Summer Festival
committee has a few seats left
on the March 17, 2007 fundraising
trip to The Resort Casino in East
Chicago.  Cost is $50 per person
with the bus departing the Knight
Bergman Civic Center at 8 am.
Coffee, juice and rolls provided
prior to departure.  Lunch pro-
vided at the casino & snacks
provided on the return home.
Please send check or money
order to:  Salamonie Summer
Festival, PO BOX 40, Warren IN
46792 by February 23, 2007.
  Include name, address, phone
& date of birth.  If you have any
questions, please contact Vickie
Grim @ (260) 375-3900.

HUNTER ED COURSE
A Hunter Educator course will be
offered Monday, March 5th,
Wednesday, March 7th and
Thursday, March 8th, 6 – 9 PM at
the Wells County Community
Center at the 4-H Park.
  Participants completing the
class will receive certification
which is required to obtain a
hunting license in Indiana and
other states.
  Pre-registration is required by
calling 260-824-0692. The class
is free and open to the public.
Youth who are under age 16
must be accompanied by a
guardian. Attendance at all
classes is required for comple-
tion.
  Class instructors will include
certified instructors Mike & Jodi
Pinkerton, Rich Falk, Tracy
Myers, and Indiana Conservation
Officer Kenny Wireman. The
event is organized by the Indiana
Department of Natural Re-
sources. For more information
and details, call 260-824-0692.

VOLUNTEER TRAINING
4-H volunteers in Northeast Indi-
ana have an opportunity to par-
ticipate in a special training “4-H
101: Building on Success”.
  The training will take place at
three locations that include:
March 12, Huntington County
Fairgrounds (Hier’s Park), Fam-
ily Living Building, 551 S. Briant

St., Huntington; March 6, Whit-
ley County 4-H Center,
Squawbuck Road, Columbia City;
and March 19, Steuben County
Extension Office, 317 S. Wayne
St., Angola.
  Time at all of the locations will
be 7 – 9 PM. Light refreshments
will be served.
  The training session for 4-H
volunteers will include: today’s 4-
H structure; parts of a 4-H club
meeting; club planning; parlia-
mentary procedure and consen-
sus building; experimental learn-
ing and updates about what’s
new for 2007.
  Registration for the three train-
ing sessions is due March 1 at
the Purdue Extension Service,
Huntington County, 260-356-4826
or Wells County, 260-824-6412.
  Information and registration
forms are available at all Purdue
Extension Service Offices lo-
cated in Adams, Allen, DeKalb,
Huntington, LaGrange, Noble,
Steuben, Wells, and Whitley
counties.
  The event is organized by the
Extension 4-H Youth Develop-
ment Staff in Northeast Indiana.

BEEF ID DAY
The Wells County 4-H Beef Iden-
tification Day will be held Satur-
day, February 24, 2007,      9 AM
– 11 AM. The event will take
place at the 4-H Park Multi-Pur-
pose Arena located behind the
Horse Barn. Snow date will be
March 3rd at the same time and
place.
  All beef steers, dairy beef steers,
and market heifers must be ear
tagged, nose printed, and
weighed to be eligible to show at
the 2007 Wells County 4-H Fair,
July 14 – 19. In addition, animals
planning to be exhibited at the
Indiana State Fair must be retinal
eye scanned.
  Commercial heifers (non-regis-
tered) will also be ear tagged,
nose printed (retinal eye scanned
if showing at the State Fair).
  Registered heifers do not need
to be brought to the ID Day.
These animals will be identified
by their registration papers which
includes their animal ear tattoo

number.
  Official livestock enrollment
forms will be available at the ID
Day and may be completed there
or turned in to the Extension
Office by March 9, 2007.
  Members who participated in
the Dairy Feeder Steer Calf
project are also encouraged to
enroll their animals in the Dairy
Beef project. These animals will
exhibit in a separate show at the
4-H Fair. The Beef Show at the
Wells County 4-H Fair is sched-
uled for Wednesday, July 18,
and the Dairy Beef Show will be
held Monday, July 16.
  Youth may also enter a calf in
the Beef Starter Class. This spe-
cial class is for calves born after
January 1st and up until June 1,
2007.
  For more information about 4-H
or the 4-H Beef project, contact
the Wells County Office of the
Purdue Cooperative Extension
Service, 1240 S. 4-H Road,
Bluffton, 260-824-6412 or Beef
Superintendent Brian Clark, 824-
0908.

WEED MANAGEMENT

The Blackford County Extension
Service will be hosting a Farmer
Update on February 20th at 6pm
at the Blackford County Fair-
grounds. Dr. Bill Johnson, Purdue
weed science specialist will
present information on
Glyphosate Management and
Herbicide Resistant Weeds. In
addition, he will also discuss
other “hot topics” in weed sci-
ence. A presentation on Protect-
ing the Water Supply on Your
Farm will be presented by Stacy
Clupper, Blackford Co. Exten-
sion Service. This program is
approved for PARP, private pes-

ticide applicator credits. Please
RSVP to the Blackford County
Extension Office by February 19th
at (765)348-3213 or
cluppers@purdue.edu.

LOCAL WOMAN TAKING

GAY RIGHTS ROADTRIP
Warren native, and current Fort
Wayne resident, Cylest Brooks
will be participating in the 2007
Soulforce Equality Ride.
  Taking note from the Freedom
Rides of the Civil Rights Move-
ment, Equality Ride utilizes
grassroots activism in its attempt
to end discrimination based on
sexual identity.  The ride, which
spans two months and takes two
separate busses (one to the East
coast and one to the West), will
visit over 30 colleges and univer-
sities in the US that have policies
condemning a homosexual
lifestyle.  “Our goal is not to
change school policies,” says
Brooks, who will be traveling along
the West-coast, “but to engage
the student body in dialogue.  In
other words, we hope to bring a
face to the issue, so that stu-
dents and faculty can see that
there is more to a person than
his/her sexuality.”
  Equality Ride is now in its sec-
ond year.  Last year a group of 33
students traveled to some of the
country’s most conservative

schools, including Liberty, Re-
gent, and Bringham Young Uni-
versities.  BYU is on the list again
for this year.
  “It is important for me, as a
straight person, to make this
effort.  In May of last year I heard
the news that an old friend of
mine had killed himself.  He was
gay.  It hit me hard and I decided
that, while he may no longer have
the voice to speak out with, I can
surely use my gifts to prevent
someone else’s life from ending.
It’s not so much a choice for me
to join this effort as an obligation
to those who are suffering.”
  “In the same way that it is not
the sole responsibility of African
Americans to fight against racial
discrimination, it is not only gays
and lesbians who should be
standing up against this injus-
tice” said Brooks.  “Martin Luther
King, Jr. said it, too: ‘Injustice
anywhere is a threat to justice
everywhere’.”
  More information about
Soulforce, the Equality Ride, or
Cylest Brooks can be found by
visiting www.soulforce.org or
www.equalityride.com.  Financial
contributions can be made to
Cylest by visiting
w w w . s o u l f o r c e . o r g /
cylest_brooks.
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128 N Wayne St • Warren
375-3401

Thanks for Shopping in Warren

HYBRID HEATING & COOLING SYSTEM

Have the best of both worlds**
a 90%+ gas furnace with an electric air

source heat pump ...
Call now for more details and to save $7,000 with the
installation of this system vs. a Closed Loop Geothermal
System.  GE Financing Available for a quick installation!

1-877-375-3010 OR 260-375-3010
Easily located at the Stop Light in Warren

Adam Stroup, Agent
2815 N Jefferson Street

Huntington, Indiana 46750-8807

Bus: 260-356-2522 • Fax: 866-323-0025 • Res: 260-758-2048

Email: Adam Stroup@infarmbureau.com

Auto • Home • Life • Annuities • Business • Farm

www.infarmbureau.com

EUCHRE CLUB
The Jackson Township Euchre
Club met at the home of Joyce
Willman, Phyllis Dickey won
High, Marge Jones had Low and
Sharon Gebhart and Nancy
Willman tied for most Lones.
Others enjoying the evening were
Rosemary Helm, Mary Ann
Monce, LuEllyn Pond, Doris
Tyner, Sue Cavanaugh, Janie
Lieurance and Carolyn Carroll.
Next month we will meet at the
home of Sharon Gebhart.

CHAUTAUQUA
The Chautauqua Club met Feb-
ruary 2, 2007 at 1:30 p.m. in the
Calico Room at Heritage Pointe.
President Jane Ruble opened the
meeting asking everyone to re-
peat the creed.  Roll call was
answered by 20 members and 1
guest sharing a memory of a
School Valentine Box.
  Secretary report read.  Trea-
surer reported a balance of
$191.02 on February 2.
  Motion by Barbara Baer that
the treasurer purchase checks,
second by Ann Brauchla, motion
carried.
  Mary Emma Huffman shared
old papers from Chautauqua
meetings.  She gave them to
Jane to look through.
  Motion by Nancy Bonham that
Chautauqua give $50.00 to the
Food Bank.  Second by Elaine
Eckman, motion carried.
  Oma Zent introduced Della Mae
Thomas who gave a very interest-
ing lesson on oil painting.  Della
lives here at Heritage Pointe,
coming here in September from
Michigan.  She also gives art
classes at Heritage Pointe.  She
painted a beautiful picture and
shared many helpful painting tips.
  Jane closed the meeting with
this thought:  Keep your faith in
all Beautiful things:  In the sun
when it is hidden, In the Spring
when it is gone.
  The next meeting is March 2
with hostesses Martha Shafer
and Lou Ann Shafer, Program
Sue Blair.
  Lovely refreshments were served
by Sharon Gebhart and Lu Ellyn
Pond to:  Barbara Baer, Janet
Beavans, Nancy Bonham, Ann
Brauchla, Elaine Eckman,
Phyliss Hubartt, Karen
Hunnicutt, Jane Ruble, Roberta
St John, Peggy Schweikhardt,
Martha Shafer, Carolyn Sparks,
Alice Whitmore, Oma Zent, Mary
Brown, Ruth Alice Christner, Mary
Emma Huffman, Bertha Turner
and guest Della Mae Thomas.

March 11, 1885 George
Kriegbaum came to Warren and
began his business venture in a
career that extended over many
years. The business, hardware
and implement, progressed well
using a German background and
an eagerness to succeed. He
was previously employed in
Springfield where they were de-
veloping the Champion line of
reapers. This provided a good
item for selling and a good im-
provement for the farmer.
  After two years, George moved
to a building that stood in back of
the present town hall. By then he
had added a good supply of oil
well supplies and widened the
implement business. He moved
the store three more times, down
by the river, into Dr. Hupp’s one
story building, and to the three
stories building on the corner of
First and Wayne.
  Early in the 1900s, George pur-
chased the hardware stock from
McIlwain and the building that
housed it. This was located in the
brick building of Warren Service
and Supply. Over the years there
were many changes in the busi-
ness. It was not uncommon for
the company to sell four or five
car loads of wind pumps in a
season. Selling buggies, car-
riages, and wagons, were a big
business and threshing ma-
chines, tractors, and trucks
added to the sale.
  George’s brother, Albert, joined
him and George’s sons, also,
worked in the company. Ralph
was the bookkeeper and Clarence
specialized in the self hardware
of the store. Long time employ-
ees of the store were Henry
Roush, Henry Ruble and Curtis
Fox. Other sales clerks were Bill
Younce, Bill Winningham,
Frances Parker, Lloyd Cook,
Meredith Thompson, Elbert Blair,
Joe Clevenger and Frank Simon.
  George and Albert retired in
1940. Ralph and Clarence took
over the business and were joined,
in 1945, by a sister, Bertha, who
did clerical work. This business
was very successful until 1966,
when it was sold to Vernon Kaehr,
who operated the business for

two years. The building was sold
to Warren Service and Supply
which ended the run of the old
time hardware.

CLOSET MUMBLINGS

  by The FlyLady, Marla Cilley
Our journey through life starts
with our first breath and it ends
with our last one. Since our birth
we have packed many bags for
our trip. We are born naked but
then we have to put clothes on
our bodies. These clothes tell our
history; from the baby shoes we
took our first steps, to the dress
we wore to the prom, our wedding
dress and then to the pregnant
clothes we wore when we gave
birth. I’ll wager that your closet
recounts many of the chapters of
your life.
  Our closets are filled to over
flowing. Each time we open our
closet door we have a conversa-
tion with those clothes.  If the
truth be known we actually wear
only a few items in our closet.
The rest are there to beat us up
and pretend to rescue us. Our
clothes have a way of making us
feel bad.
  Just think about your wedding
dress that no longer fits your
body. What are your first
thoughts? How could I let this
happen to me? I looked so good
that day. Then I want you to think
about how you starved yourself
to death to fit into that dress in
the first place.
  Why do we do this to ourselves?
Why can’t we just be happy with
ourselves just like we were? We
were trying to fit into an unrealis-
tic picture that only stays with us
for that fleeting moment.
  Those nasty conversations go
on each time you walk into your
closet. If it isn’t about a wedding
dress it is about another favorite
outfit that you paid good money
for that is too tight. It is time for us
to quiet these beratings and get
on with our flight without feeling
guilty.
  There is an easy way to banish
these voices from your head; get
them out of your closet and only
keep items of clothing that you
absolutely adore and feel like a
million buck in when you wear
them. Decluttering your closet is
not going to kill you; in fact it may
just save your life.
  It is time we packed for our
journey. Our closets are no longer
going to stand in our way of

traveling light and enjoying our
trip. Most of us only wear about
10% of the clothes we have
stashed in there anyway. Let’s
lighten our load and get rid of
those nasty voices once and for
all; Out of sight, out of mind! We
can do this.
  First we need to look at the
clothes we truly love because we
feel good in them. This goes for
your shoes too. Pull those out of
your closet one at a time and
think about the words you hear in
your head when you have them
on. Now put them back in your
closet and pull out something
that does not give you the same
feeling. If the item of clothing
makes you feel bad, evokes feel-
ings of guilt in you or you just
don’t like it; then put it in the give-
away box. If you have changed
careers and no longer have to get
dressed into suits then donate
them so others can start their
new jobs and look nice. Let me
warn you. Going through your
closet is difficult because of all
the stories that you clothes dredge
up. This is why I only want you to
spend 15 minutes at a time doing
this. Do not spend hours this will
make you feel too badly. Bless
yourself by being kind to you.
  Over the next week of spending
15 minutes a day culling the
clothes that do not bless you any
longer, you will begin to see a
pattern to your favorite items. I
call it your personal uniform. We
all have a favorite color, fabric or
style that makes us smile. Look
at your clothes with an eye for
your style. It is all about what you
love and how you feel when you
wear your clothes.
  For more help getting rid of your

CHAOS; check out her website

and join her free mentoring group

at  www.FlyLady.net or her book,

Sink Reflections published by

Bantam and her new book, Body

Clutter published by Fireside.

Copyright 2007 Marla Cilley Used

by permission in this publica-

tion.

DINNER HABIT
  by The Dinner Diva, Leanne Ely
One of the pitfalls in trying to get
a new habit going (like making
dinner for example) is not being
clear on the goal. It’s one thing to
say you’re going to make dinner
every night instead of eating take-
out (stay away from the Chinese
takeout! See last week’s Dinner
Diva column on my Takeout Con-
fessional), but it’s another thing
entirely to quantify your goal.
  Here are three things you need
to do to make a new habit:
   1— Make a serious commit-
ment, not just run your mouth.
As SHE’s (sidetracked home
executives) we are the Queens of
Running Mouths. We talk a blue
streak, but actually doing some-
thing about it takes a while before
we get that it isn’t the talking
about it that will do it, it’s the
DOING something about it that
will do it! For dinner making, that
means committing to meal plan-
ning, making a grocery list, shop-
ping and then making the time to
prepare the meal. It takes a little
doing, but it is well worth the
effort.
  2— Examine the benefits of
doing all of this. It’s huge-, your
children do better in school, are
less likely to do all the things you
DON’T want them doing and are
happier, more secure and nutri-
tionally, better fed. You’ve heard
me talk time and time again (or

CONTINUED PAGE 6



Friday, February 16, 2007  WARREN WEEKLY  5

GENEALOGY REPORT

CAMPBELL & DYE INSURANCE, Inc.

Karen S. Campbell
Individual, Group & Senior

HEALTH BENEFITS

Call for a free Quote

(260) 375-2424

Time
To Do
Income
Taxes
Again

  Call

at 260-375-2426

NORTHVIEW APARTMENTS

602 N 1st St in Van Buren

Affordable Living for the Elderly and Disabled
Winter Specials on Security Deposit/Rent May Apply

Please Call Today 765-934-3200
Jerry Doyle - Property Manager

Equal Housing Opportunity

260-375-4606

M-F 9-5, Sat. 9-12

1 mile East of
Warren on 1000S      .

(3rd St. Ext.)

Greenhouse & Floral Barn

   Now and

     Forever...

Complete wedding

services, from design

consultation to

custom arrangements,

both fresh and silk.

JAMES
David Eric James, 47, 10976W-
800S-90, Warren, died at 4:20
p.m. Tuesday (Feb. 6, 2007) at
Lutheran Hospital in Fort Wayne.
  Mr. James was a lifelong resi-
dent of Jackson Township, Wells
County. He maintained a career
in truck driving for a majority of
his life and formerly drove for
Ryder Logistics in Warren and
Ormsby Trucking in Uniondale.
He was an outdoorsman and
enjoyed Colts football and Harley
Davidson Motorcycles. He was a
graduate of Southern Wells High
School.
  He was born April 7, 1959, a
son of J. Richard and Cora Lea
Banter James. His mother sur-
vives in Bluffton. He married Rose
L. Schlotter in Montpelier on June
16, 1984. His wife survives.
  Also surviving are two sons,
John “Bud” Major and Zachariah
David James, both of Warren;
two daughters, Miranda Gephart
and Elizabeth Rose James, both
of Warren; two brothers, Rodney
James, Van Buren, and Roland
James, Columbia City; two sis-
ters, Mona Sink, Roanoke, and
Rhonda Snover, Fort Wayne; and
two grandsons.
  Services were held at the Glancy
Funeral Homes - H. Brown and
Son Chapel, Warren with Dan
Coffman officiating. Burial was at
the Jones Cemetery in Wells
County.
  Preferred memorials are to the
family in care of Glancy Funeral
Homes - H. Brown and Son
Chapel, 203 N. Matilda St., War-
ren, IN 46792.

BARTRAM
H. Bernard Bertram, 84, of India-
napolis, a former resident of Hun-
tington County died at 2:55 a.m.
on Wednesday, Feb. 7, 2007 at
Eaglecreek Health & Rehabilita-
tion Center in Indianapolis. He
was a farmer in Huntington
County for 25 years. He also

worked for the Huntington County
Highway Department for many
years, having retired in 1983.
  He was born in Huntington
County on Mar. 17, 1922, the son
of Harry Phillip and Marie
(Mygrant) Bartram. He was a
1939 graduate of Rock Creek
Township High School in Hun-
tington County. He was married
in Indianapolis on Apr. 17, 1949
to Grace (Harlow) Bartram, who
preceded him in death on July
22, 2005.
  He was also preceded in death
by his half-brother John Bartram
and a half-sister Ruth Newman.
He is survived by his daughter
Diane (Terry) Reed of Indianapo-
lis and by three grandchildren.
  A private family service was
held at Gardens of Memory in
Marion with the Rev. Darren
Cushman Wood officiating. Me-
morials may be made to the
Warren Church of Christ. Funeral
arrangements are from the
Glancy Funeral Homes - H.
Brown & Son Chapel in Warren.

CULP
A longtime Wells County resi-
dent, Raymond D. Culp, 83, of
Las Cruces, N.M., died at 5:55
a.m. Thursday, Feb. 8, 2007, at
his daughter’s home in Las
Cruces.
  Mr. Culp was a railroad worker
for 30 years and helped with
most of the track and switch
installation in the Bluffton area.
For the last four years, he was a
watchman, retiring in 1972.
  A Navy veteran with service
during World War II, Mr. Culp
was a member of American Le-
gion Post #111. A talented musi-
cian, he enjoyed writing and sing-
ing his own songs.
  Born on May 9, 1923, in
Gilbertsville, Ky., he was a son of
William and Lavada (Washburn)
Culp, and attended Liberty Cen-
ter High School. His marriage on
April 19, 1944, in Bluffton was to
Freda E. (Harris) Culp, who pre-
ceded him in death on July 10,
1998.
  Survivors include two daugh-
ters, Reta Culp of Las Cruces,
N.M., and Sharon Kay (Billy Joe)
Binnion of Franklin, Ark.; six
grandchildren; and 12 great-
grandchildren.
  He was preceded in death by
two brothers, Marion Culp and
Johnny Culp.

  Services were held at Thoma/
Rich, Hewitt & Chaney Funeral
Home with Pastor Phil Harris
officiating.
  Burial will be in Woodlawn Cem-
etery, Warren. Military graveside
honors will be performed by
American Legion Post #111. Pre-
ferred memorials are to the Ar-
thritis Foundation.

ROGERS
Garry D. Rogers, 69, of Bluffton
died at 6:29 p.m. Saturday, Feb.
10, 2007, at Bluffton Regional
Medical Center.
  Mr. Rogers worked for 20 years
as Water Treatment Plant Op-
erator for the City of Bluffton. He
had served 20 years in the Air
Force, retiring in 1975. Member-
ships included American Legion
Post #111 and the V.F.W.

  Born on July 14, 1937,
in Kentucky, he was a
son of William D. and

Effie May (Baker) Rogers. His
marriage on May 26, 1970, in
Newport, Ky., was to Anita F.
(James) Rogers, who survives.
  Other survivors include children
Will Rogers of Bluffton, Teresa A.
Shidler of Warren, Charlie Sparks
of Charlotte, N.C., Gary Sparks
of Stanton, Ky., Dennis Sparks
of Winchester, Ky., and Cathy
Forbes of Fort Wayne; siblings
Wanda Smith of Richmond, Ky.,
and Kenny Rogers, Raymond
Rogers and Gladys Townswend,
all of Stanton, Ky.; 21 grandchil-
dren; and five great-grandchildren.
  He was preceded in death by
sisters Wilma Rogers and Arnice
Kaylor; and brothers Paul Rogers,
Hargis Jackson and William Jr.
Rogers.
  Services were held at Thoma/
Rich, Hewitt & Chaney Funeral
Home.
  Burial will be in Six Mile Cem-
etery, Bluffton, with military
graveside honors by American
Legion Post #111. Preferred
memorials are to the American
Diabetes Association.

JACKSON
Ruby I. Jackson, 92, Warren, a
former resident of Uniondale, died
Sunday (Feb. 11, 2007) at Heri-
tage Point in Warren.
  She had been a sales clerk at
numerous retail stores in Wells
and Huntington counties and had
also worked at Square D in Hun-

tington. She was also a home-
maker. She was a member of the
Uniondale United Methodist
Church and the Church Women
Society, and was a member of a
home economics club.
  She was born Sept. 22, 1914, in
Huntington County, to Edgar and
Ada Dale Stroud. She married
Norman H. Jackson May 13,
1933; her husband survives.
  Also surviving are three sons,
Robert D. Jackson of Markle,
Thomas A. Jackson of Urbana,
and David E. Jackson of Bluffton;
two daughters, Ann Sparks and
Barbara J. Keplinger, both of
Markle; and 13 grandchildren, 13
great-grandchildren, and one
great-great-grandchild.
  A granddaughter and two broth-
ers preceded her in death.
  Calling will be from 2 to 4 and 6
to 8 p.m. Thursday and from 10 to
11 a.m. Friday at the Elzey
Patterson Rodak Funeral Home,
Ossian Chapel, 120 W. Mill St.,
Ossian. Services will be held at
11 a.m. Friday at the funeral
home with Revs. Troy Drayer and
Joe Haney officiating. Burial will
be at the Horeb Cemetery, rural
Uniondale.
  Preferred memorials are to the
Uniondale United Methodist
Church and Family Hospice of
Northeast Indiana.

SEND YOUR FAVORITE OUT-OF-TOWNER, COLLEGE

STUDENT OR RELATIVE A SUBSCRIPTION TO THE

WARREN WEEKLY.  IT MAKES A TREASURED  GIFT

EVERY YEAR.  (SEE PAGE 7 FOR DETAILS)
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      Warren
   Pharmacy

260/375-2135

It pays to shop at the

Warren Pharmacy

Now Available

Hitzfield’s

Chunk Beef

28 oz. can

$6.50

Comfort Inn - Warren
Birthday / Pool Party

Total Package Includes:
         • Meeting Room for maximum of 20 people

• 4 Hours Maximum
• Use of the Pool and Hot Tub

    Call for Availability 375-4800

MORE PAGE 4
you have read in my columns
time and time again) of the value
of the family dinner table -psy-
chologically, socially and nutri-
tionally. One meal can make that
much of a difference!
  3—-Have a back up plan. There
is no shame in ordering pizza
ONCE IN A WHILE or making
breakfast for dinner, or anything
else that shortcuts your way to
the dinner table. The big thing
here is actually EATING together.
  And please remember this. No
one likes a dinnertime martyr
anymore than they like the
housekeeping martyr. Don’t be
afraid to tell “your people” what
you need. Have your kids help
with dinner (hands on nutrition;
life skills that will serve your chil-
dren forever), have your husband
help with grocery shopping and
everyone pitch in for dishes. Din-
ner and meal making can be a
family affair if you will help or-
chestrate it. Have a family meet-
ing, get your crew on board and
go for it! It’s worth the effort!
  Here’s an easy recipe to get
your dinner going in the right
direction:
  Roasted Vegetable Cheddar
Soup
  Serves 6
  2 large rutabagas, peeled and
quartered
  2 large turnips, peeled and quar-
tered
  1 large onion, quartered
  6 cloves garlic, whole
  1 large head of cauliflower, bro-
ken up
  3 tablespoons olive oil
  Salt and pepper, to taste
  1 1/2 teaspoons thyme
  3 cups chicken broth or veg-
etable broth
  1 1/2 cups half and half
  1 tablespoon flour
  1 1/2 cups low-fat cheddar
cheese, grated

  Preheat oven to 425 degrees. In
a large roasting pan, add all the
vegetables and toss well with the
olive oil, salt and pepper and
thyme. Cook for 30 minutes or
until veggies start to turn brown.
Remove from the oven, set aside
and let cool.
  In a blender, add cooled roasted
veggies and 1/4 cup of the
chicken broth (or more, you just
want to help the blender blend
the veggies and it needs liquid).
Pulse the blender - you don’t
want your veggies liquefied, just
blended.
  In a large saucepan, dump the
contents of the blender, the rest
of the chicken broth and heat to
boiling. Lower the heat to a sim-
mer and add the cream. When it
is hot (but NOT boiling, or the
cream will break!) add the cheese
tossed with the flour. Again, bring
to almost boiling, turn down the
heat and serve.
  Per serving: 345 Calories; 17g
Total Fat; 13g Protein; 3g Dietary
Fiber; 14g Carbohydrate; 111mg
Cholesterol; 616mg Sodium Food
Exchanges: 0 Grain (Starch); 1
Lean Meat; 1 Vegetable; 0 Fruit;
7 Fat; 0 Other Carbohydrates
  SERVING SUGGESTIONS:
Garnish with additional shredded
cheddar cheese and serve with a
spinach salad. Add some whole
grain rolls. A great, easy meal!
  For more help putting dinner on

your table check out her website

). www.SavingDinner.com or her

Saving Dinner Book series pub-

lished by Ballantine and her new

book Body Clutter, published by

Fireside.  Copyright 2007; Leanne

Ely Used by permission in this

publication.

BE A FINANCIAL GURU

Imagine putting aside extra
money each month.  Don’t think
it’s feasible?  Look no further
than the coins rattling around in
your pocket.  Starting small is
ok, as long as you start.
  Whether you’re saving for your
own home, starting your kid’s
college fund, or adding to your
retirement nest egg, saving your
spare change and making small
changes in your spending habits
can add up to big money.  Learn

about the different ways you can
develop and improve your sav-
ings, investment, and retirement
strategies with the free Financial
Planning kit from the MetLife
Consumer Education Center and
Federal Citizen Information Cen-
ter.
  Begin by using the handy
worksheet to map out your
monthly spending plan.  Fill in
your total income and subtract
your expenses such as housing,
food, clothing, gas, and enter-
tainment from this total.  If you
want to increase the amount
you’re saving, look over the plan
to see where you can reduce
your expenses.
  Here are a few ideas to help you
get started.  Take your lunch to
work and have more meals at
home.  Shop around for a free
checking account or one with no
minimum balance requirement.
Use coupons when you shop,
compare unit prices, and always
grocery shop with a list.  And ask
your physician about switching
to generic drugs.
  With all of your savings, you
need to make sure you choose
the best savings and investment
options.  That’s why the Finan-
cial Planning kit features useful
information on certificates of de-
posit (CDs), stocks, bonds, mu-
tual funds, and more.  This infor-
mative kit also gives you the
facts on the different types of
retirement savings accounts,
such as 401(k) plans, and how to
make the most out of your contri-
butions.
  You may think having a will is
only for the wealthy or those with
children.  But a will is important,
because it ensures that your
assets, whatever they are, are
distributed according to your
wishes after you die.  Find out
what you’ll need to consider when
creating your will, including des-
ignating a guardian for any minor
children and naming an execu-
tor, with the Financial Planning
kit.
  So round up your lucky pennies
and start achieving your financial
goals.  Send for the free Financial
Planning kit today. There are
three easy ways to get your free
publications:
  Send your name and address

to Financial Planning, Pueblo,
Colorado 81009.
  Visit www.pueblo.gsa.gov/rc/
n54financialplanning.htm to
place your order online or to read
or print these and hundreds of
other Federal publications for free.
  Call toll-free 1 (888) 8 PUEBLO.
That’s 1 (888) 878-3256,
weekdays 8 a.m. to 8 p.m. East-
ern Time and ask for the
Financial Planning kit.
  Get even more information and
take advantage of online
government services resources
at www.FirstGov.gov and
www.Espanol.gov—your official
English and Spanish web
portals to the Federal govern-
ment.

GET A GREAT DEAL
Before you pick out the interior
color and trim on your new car,
you need to make sure the deal
you’re getting is a good one.  Get
helpful hints on how to make a
smart purchase with How to Get
a Great Deal on a New Car from
the Center for the Study of Ser-
vices and the USDA’s Coopera-
tive State Research, Education,
and Extension Service.  Educate
yourself about features such as
extended service contracts,
trade-in values, rebates, and other
incentives with this useful publi-
cation.  This booklet costs $1.00.
For a copy, send your name,
address, and a check or money
order for $1.00 the Federal Citi-
zen Information Center, Dept.
305P, Pueblo, CO 81009.  Or call
toll-free 1 (888) 8 PUEBLO, that’s
1 (888) 878-3256, and ask for
Item 305P.  And visit
www.pueblo.gsa.gov to read or
print this and hundreds of
other FCIC publications for free.

SPORTS INJURIES
Andre Agassi may be a profes-
sional athlete in great physical
shape, but he’s probably got some
of the same soreness and stiff-
ness that you do.  If you’re active
like so many of today’s adults,
you’ve probably had a few twinges
that spring up unexpectedly.  To
learn how to prevent injuries and
what to do if you are hurt, order
the free Sports Injuries package
from the National Institutes of

Health, the Food and Drug Ad-
ministration, and the Federal Citi-
zen Information Center.
  Whether you’ve always been
active or just recently decided to
exercise more, congratulations!
Along with eating right, exercis-
ing on a regular basis can do
wonders for many aspects of
your health.  But you need to
treat your body a little better than
you did when you were in your
teens or twenties.  The tendons
and ligaments around your joints
become less stretchy with age,
so warming up and cooling down
properly is important.  Accepting
your body’s limits can also pre-
vent needless injuries.  You may
not be in the same shape you
were 10 or 20 years ago, but if
you follow the prevention tips in
this package and increase your
activity levels gradually, you’ll
have a better chance of exercis-
ing without getting injured.
  If you do get hurt, don’t ignore
the injury.  You can take care of
minor pain at home using the
RICE method—rest, ice, com-
pression, and elevation.  But if
the pain persists or there’s a lot
of swelling, see a doctor.  A small
fracture or torn ligament left un-
treated could quickly become a
chronic source of pain that is
difficult to treat.  Use the book-
lets in this package to learn more
about the injuries you should
watch out for, including shoulder
problems.  And find out what
treatments are available, whether
you need a cast for a broken
bone or joint replacement sur-
gery for your arthritic knee.
  Learn how to avoid injuries and
recover the right way if you do get
hurt by ordering the Sports Inju-
ries package.  There are three
easy ways to get your free publi-
cations:
  Send your name and address
to Sports Injuries, Pueblo,
Colorado 81009.
  Visit www.pueblo.gsa.gov/rc/
n55sportsinjuries.htm to place
your order online or to read or
print these and hundreds of other
Federal publications for free.
  Call toll-free 1 (888) 8 PUEBLO.
That’s 1 (888) 878-3256,
weekdays 8 a.m. to 8 p.m. East-
ern Time and ask for the Sports
Injuries package.
  Get even more information and
take advantage of online
government services resources
at www.FirstGov.gov and
www.Espanol.gov—your official
English and Spanish web
portals to the Federal govern-
ment.
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CLASSIFIEDS

  Name __________________________________________

  Address ________________________________________

  City, State, Zip Code _____________________________

1 Year Subscription $38.00 ___ 6 Months $19.00 ___

3 Months $9.50 ___

Renewal ___ or New Subscription ___

(Subscriptions to be mailed 1st Class)

   Send to:
WARREN WEEKLY • P O Box 695, Warren, IN  46792

Subscription Form to

THE WARREN WEEKLY

Send in your ad today!

  Please PRINT your ad and Phone Number carefully.

   Name: ______________________________________________
   Your ad: ____________________________________________
   _________________________________________________________
   _________________________________________________________
   Phone Number:  ______________________________________
   Run my ad ______ times    Enclosed is $ _______________

Payment must accompany order.

RATES
20 words $3.50.  Each word over 20 words is $.10 per word.  Each
additional insertion is the same price as the first time.
Send in your ad -- include name, address, and phone number (for our
records) and number of times you wish ad to run.  We reserve the right to
edit all ads.  Send to: WARREN WEEKLY, P O Box 695, Warren, IN  46792,
OR drop off at PJ's Flower and Gift, Downtown Warren by 10 a.m. on
Tuesday for the Friday edition.

EXAMPLE
For Sale -- 1986 Ford Fairlane, 4 door, power steering and brakes,
  1      2        3       4        5        6      7          8          9          10     11

10321 N. Victory, Warren.  Phone 260-000-0000.

 12    13        14       15          16         17       18

           (260)356-3260

• MIKE CRAGO • DOUG WILEY •

WE SPECIALIZE IN AIR DUCT CLEANING

BARGAIN BASEMENT

is full of clothes, household and
misc.  Open 9 am to 4 pm every
Fri and Sat.  Check us out and

help your community while
helping yourself.

Open Fri. and Sat.9 to 4              T
TOWING

Damage-free with wheel lift.
D & S Lubritory.

Garage 765-934-2502               T*
DeWEESE  SOFT WATER  AND

APPLIANCE

A Technetic dealer,  375-3828  T*
WARE-BRANDON

MONUMENTS

Serving the Warren  Area  with
markers and monuments since

1888.  Owner,  Pete Sorg
375-2705.  Associate Mark

           Vickrey, 375-3804.           T*
TRANSMISSION REPAIRS &

REBUILDS

Automatic and manuals.  All work
warranted up to 3 yrs/36,000
miles.  Will beat or match any
estimate.  Call 260/622-7210

during the day or 260/694-6464

after 6 p.m.                                   T*
HOUSE FOR SALE/RENT TO

OWN

3 BR, 2BA, 1160SF.  Only 3 years
old.  LIKE NEW!  $91,900.

Owner Financing
Availabel(260)438-2108 or

www.madehomes.com        2/16*

www.ZZTOPPS.net

Maker of Whimsical,
Seasonal  and Solid
Color Scrub Tops,
Drawstring Pants,

Jackets and
Stethoscope Covers.

Now making Long Sleeve Scrub

shirts and OR hats too.

        Call Nicki at 375-3531         .

Monday
Savory Turkey Breast

& Ham
Tuesday

Meatball Marinara
Wednesday

Savory Turkey Breast
Thursday

Italian B.M.T.
Friday

Classic Tuna
Saturday
Roast Beef
Sunday

Oven Roasted
Chicken Breast

Valid Only At:

Subway/Warren
Deli

I69 & SR 5

  $2.79

Ben Herr

CALL FOR QUOTES

Cell: 260/417-2740
 260/375-3777

Lawn Fertilizing, New Lawns, Lawn

Rolling, Driveway Repair, Post Hole

Digging, Landscaping, Lawn Mowing

HOMES FOR SALE/RENT TO

OWN

Homes in Warren, Huntington,
Bluffton, Decatur and Ossian.

Broker owned.  Visit
www.madehomes.com or

         (260)438-2108.             2/16*
FOR RENT

3 bedroom duplex, very nice &
clean, 1 car garage, no pets,

non-smoking  375-3559

                                                  2/23*
FOR SALE

Reconditioned Kerosene space
heaters, upright vacuum cleaner,

Toro snow blower, chainsaw.
Daryl's Lawn Mower Repair &

     Welding  375-4151          2/23*

Service Directory
Housekeeping

Ann B. (Alice) Davis ................................. 375-0000

Daycare

Mr. Giles French ....................................... 694-0000

HandyMan/Woman

Ralph Furley ......................................765/934-0000

Call the Warren Weekly today to be included

in this weekly directory.  List your Category,

name & phone number for just $5.00 per

month, per category (paid in advance).

The Warren Weekly assumes no responsibility for any claims made or work

performed  by persons advertising in this directory.

Available on Wed.,
Feb. 14 only!

Made with
Heart Shaped

Pepperoni

DINE IN

CARRY OUT

DELIVERY

Warren

375-2000

Surprise your
Valentine with a
Heart Shaped

Pepperoni Pizza
       for 2

 $899

                               1-888-701-0156

                           www.EvaSold.us

WELLS

6254 S 600W Mt Zion ........... $76,500
WARREN

Langton Estates starting @   $16,900
118 E Parkway Dr (Lot)......... $11,500
120 N Main St ........................ $72,900
4060 E 1100S (Lot 4.8 Acres)...... $25,000
407 E 5th St ............................... $82,900
4094 E 1100 S ......................... $155,500
410 N Main St ............................ $83,500
443 W 12th St .......................... $115,000
519 E Third St (New) ................ $19,900
8744 S Meridian Rd (15.5 A) .. $259,900
HUNTINGTON

1S & 2S Marion Rd (1.5 A each).  $15,000
2430 Waterworks Rd ............. $119,900
4215 S Warren Rd .................... $79,900
71E 500 S .....(Reduced)........... $64,900
802 First St (New) ..................... $39,900
848 Esther St (New) ................. $24,900
88 W 412 S, Majenica (Reduced) . $87,900
HARTFORD CITY

408 E Kickapoo St ................. $81,000
MONTPELIER

222 N Adams St..................... $28,000
VAN BUREN

610 E Main St .(10 Acres)... $139,900
6875E 500N ........................ $145,000
SUMMITVILLE

2142 E 1700 N (New) ......... $198,000

Support
the

businesses
who bring

you
Your

Hometown
News
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AREA NEWS CONTINUED

260-375-3255HWY. 5, WARRENOPEN MON-SAT 5 A.M. - 11 P.M.

CLOSED SUNDAY

YOUR WARREN ECKRICH SAVINGS STORE
All Sale Prices good thru February 17, 2007

• Hamburger.......... $2.09 lb

• Chuck Roast....... $2.69 lb

• Cube Steak......... $3.29 lb

• Pork Sausage..... $1.99 lb

• Pork Chops......... $2.99 lb

• T-Bone................ $7.49 lb

• Pork Ribs ........... $1.99 lb

• Pork Steak ......... $2.19 lb

• Sirloin Roast ...... $3.19 lb

WE CARRY FREEZER BEEF & PORK!

CHEESES
Swiss, Pepper jack,
Colby Jack, Colby

$4.49lb.
Reg. $5.99 SAVE $1.50

TURKEY
Cajun, Honeyroast,

Oven Roast

$4.49lb
Reg. $5.99 SAVE $1.50

Honey Cured Ham

Virginia Baked Ham

$4.49lb.

Cooked Ham

$2.89lb.
Reg. $4.59 SAVE $1.70

Chicken Breast
Honey-Roasted

or Barbecue

$4.49lb
Reg. $5.99 SAVE $1.50

Deli Sliced
Bologna

$2.49lb
Summer Sausage (whole) ... $5.99

FROM THE DELI PACKAGE FEATURES

Bacon - 1lb.

$2.99
Reg. $3.49 SAVE 50¢

Smokies - 1 lb.

$1.99
Reg. $2.19 SAVE 20¢

Ashby’s Hard Ice Cream 12 Flavors

and Soft Serve Ice Cream 3 Flavors

MarkleBank ATM Available

Coming Soon:
Fax & Copier Machine

Coke & Pepsi 2 Liters

2 for $2.22

PAY AT THE PUMP

AVAILABLE 24-7

1234567890123456789
1234567890123456789
1234567890123456789
1234567890123456789
1234567890123456789
1234567890123456789
1234567890123456789
1234567890123456789
1234567890123456789
1234567890123456789
1234567890123456789
1234567890123456789
1234567890123456789
1234567890123456789

Bread of Life
Food Pantry Hours

Wednesday 4-5:30 p.m.
Saturday 10 to 11:30

at Knight Civic Center or
Call for an appointment

375-2381

MORE PAGE 2
these tips to parents:
  * Have materials available. Stock
the house with newspapers,
magazines and books to per-
suade children to read instead of
turning on the television or play-
ing a video game.
  * Make reading a daily exer-
cise. Statistics show that chil-
dren who are encouraged by their
parents to read are more likely to
read a higher number of books.
  * Set and reward reading goals.
Build enthusiasm by providing a
special treat when a reading tar-
get is reached. Positive reinforce-
ment can help boost motivation.
  “A good book can ignite the
imagination of youngsters, and
parents are the best coaches to
rev up reading fun,” Weaver said.
  For more tips or information
about Read Across America, visit
www.nea.org/readacross.

AFFINITY FRAUD
Don’t let the fancy name confuse
you.  Affinity fraud  is nothing
more complicated than invest-
ment scams targeted  at a spe-
cific group of people by someone
who claims to be  part of that
group.  Although the returns can
sound solid,  it pays to be wary.
One hundred Texas seniors lost
$2.5  million to fraudsters who
encouraged them to liquidate
their retirement savings and in-
vest them in securities with
higher returns.  In another
scheme, a group of 375 mostly
African-American investors were
told they could get profits
of up to 300 percent with no risk
to their principal.  They
lost at least $2.8 million.  This
type of fraud is real, and it can
happen to you, too.  Learn how to
avoid becoming  a victim with
Affinity Fraud from the U.S. Se-
curities and  Exchange Commis-
sion.  For your free copy, send
your name  and address to the
Federal Citizen Information Cen-
ter,  Dept. 592P, Pueblo, CO
81009.  Or call toll-free 1 (888) 8
PUEBLO, that’s 1 (888) 878-
3256, and ask for Item 592P.
And visit www.pueblo.gsa.gov to
place your order online or
to read or print this and hundreds
of other FCIC  publications for
free.

KEEP A HEALTHY HOME
You may have some uninvited
guests creeping around
your home.  And they’re not your
relatives.  They’re  allergens such
as dust mites, animal dander,
and molds that  reduce the qual-
ity of the air in your home and can
harm  your family’s health.
  Find out how to protect your
home from these unwanted
visitors with the new Healthy
Home package.  This free
package is filled with helpful pub-
lications from the  Environmental
Protection Agency, the FDA Of-
fice of Women’s  Health, and The
Soap and Detergent Associa-
tion.
  Start by conducting a room-by-
room assessment of your
home using the handy checklist
in this package.  Be on the
look out for unusual and notice-
able odors, excessive  moisture
or condensation, vapors that could
be harmful, and  dust that could
be from asbestos or lead.  These
signs are  good indicators that
the air in your home may be
unhealthy.  Moisture in your
kitchen, bathrooms, and laundry
room, for  instance, encourages
the growth of mold and mildew
and  attracts cockroaches and
dust mites.
     And for millions of Americans,
exposure to these  household
irritants triggers their allergies.

An allergy  is your body’s ad-
verse reaction to a substance
that doesn’t  bother other people.
Symptoms include watery eyes,
runny  nose, sneezing, nasal
congestion, and coughing.  In-
door  allergens also play a signifi-
cant role in causing asthma
attacks.  Learn more about
asthma, including how to keep it
under control, with this informa-
tive package.
     Although indoor allergens are
a common problem, there  are
things you can do to keep your
home healthy.  One of  the most
effective and least expensive ways
is to clean as  often as possible.
Wash bedding, such as sheets,
bedcovers, and blankets, once a
week in hot water.  Fix  water
problems and leaks and regu-
larly clean humifiders and  air
conditioners.  Store food in tightly
sealed containers.  And
clean up spills and crumbs on
kitchen counter-tops and
floors immediately.
  Get rid of those pesky visitors
by ordering the Healthy
Home package today. There are
three easy ways to  get your free
publications:
  Send your name and address
to Healthy Home, Pueblo,
Colorado 81009.
  Visit www.pueblo.gsa.gov/rc/
n56healthyhome.htm to
place your order online or to read
or print these and  hundreds of
other Federal publications for free.
  Call toll-free 1 (888) 8 PUEBLO.
That’s 1 (888) 878-3256,
weekdays 8 a.m. to 8 p.m. East-
ern Time and ask for the
Healthy Home package.

FOREIGN ENTRY
Whether your travel destination
is Canada or China,  you need to
make sure you have the official
papers  necessary for your trip.
That’s why the Department of
State has put together the handy
publication, Foreign Entry
Requirements.  It features the
passport, visa, and  immuniza-
tion requirements for 200 coun-
tries, along with  embassy and
consulate addresses and phone
numbers.  This  publication costs
$1.00. For your copy, send your
name,  address, and a check or
money order for $1.00 to the
Federal Citizen Information Cen-
ter, Dept. 349P, Pueblo, CO
81009.  Or call toll-free 1 (888) 8
PUEBLO, that’s 1 (888)
878-3256, and ask for Item 349P.
Have your credit card
handy.  And visit
www.pueblo.gsa.gov to place your
order  online or to read or print
this and hundreds of other FCIC
publications for free.

GOVERNMENT MADE EASY
 Whether you need to renew your
passport or file a  change of
address, FirstGov.gov, the U.S.
government’s  official web portal,
is your trustworthy, one-stop
source  for online government
information and services.  And to
make it easier and faster for you
to locate the resources
you need, FirstGov.gov has been
enhanced with several new
user-friendly features and re-
named USA.gov.
  USA.gov was chosen in re-
sponse to requests for a name
that is easy to understand and
remember.  The site brings
millions of Federal, state, local,
tribal, and territorial  government
web pages together in one easy-
to-navigate  place.  You can re-
new your driver’s license, shop
government auctions, apply for
Federal benefits, find  recreation
activities, and much more, all
from the comfort  of your home at
USA.gov.
  Need a photo of Ben Franklin for
your child’s history  report?  Or
how about the latest research
from the National  Institutes of
Health?  USA.gov can help.  Just
click on  ”Images” or “News” from
USA.gov’s search box, and you’ll
be  quickly connected to the
latest news items and pictures
from government sources.  From
photographs taken on Mars to

presidential speeches, USA.gov
has it all.
  Millions around the world can
now learn about  educational,
business, and tourist opportuni-
ties by using  the new “Visitors to
the U.S.” gateway.  It provides
individuals and businesses with
useful information on  exploring
U.S. tourist destinations, getting
student visas,  doing business in
the U.S., and much more.  With
easily  accessible links on every-
thing from importing U.S. goods
to  driving in the U.S., this new
gateway has something for
everyone.
  Want to know how to contact
your representative in  Congress?
How to obtain your birth certifi-
cate?  Or where  to donate blood
in your community?  Use “Online
Personal  Assistance” now avail-
able on USA.gov for quick, reli-
able  answers to these questions
and more via live web chat
Monday through Friday, noon to
8 p.m. Eastern Time.  Or
click on “Contact Us” or “Fre-
quently Asked Questions” at
the bottom of any page to email
your questions or comments,
and you’ll get a response within
two business days.
  From applying for college loans
and Social Security  benefits to
purchasing savings bonds and
surplus government  property,
you can do it all at USA.gov.
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